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Religion plays an important role in people’s 
lives and influences many aspects of our hu-
man existence. It is also intimately connected to 
mental health, including a wide variety of be-
liefs, emotions, and behaviours, some of which 
are constructive to human functioning and 
some dysfunctional. Some religious practices 
that characterise a spiritual life can be viewed 
as a sign of mental disturbance, while others 
might buffer against mental illness. The ways in 
which religiousness is connected with psycho-
logical functioning are thus very intricate and 
multifaceted. A potential factor that can help us 
explain those relationships is found in the form 
of coping with stress. While experiencing nega-
tive mental states individuals often rely on cop-
ing mechanisms and strategies that can alleviate 
their level of stress and pain. Many people turn 
to religion in order to find help and relief. The 
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Summary
The aim of this study was to assess the relationships between religiousness and mental health within the 
mediational perspective of religious coping. The existing empirical evidence indicates that specific as-
pects of religiousness are associated with mental health indices. Yet, less is known about the nature of 
these associations and mediating mechanisms between both factors. The theory of religious coping as a 
mediator was employed so as to explain how religiousness is linked with mental health and what mecha-
nisms shape the associations. The results demonstrated that religious coping can be regarded as a me-
diator between religiousness and mental health dimensions. Religious coping is expressed in two main 
forms: positive and negative that are linked to positive and negative mental health outcomes, respective-
ly. People draw on these two religious coping methods in times of major life crises in order to make sense 
of trauma and loss, and to alleviate stress. The theoretical analyses showed that when religiousness con-
tains structures of orientation and meaning, it enables individuals to attain positive functioning and well-
being that reflects mental health.

religiousness / mental health / religious coping / mediational perspective

purpose of this article is to outline the ways in 
which religiousness interacts with mental health 
within the mediational perspective of religious 
coping. 

1. The complexity of relationships be-
tween religiousness and mental health

Within psychology and psychiatry there has 
been unceasing theoretical and empirical inter-
est in examining positive and negative effects 
of religiousness on mental health. Previous re-
search has investigated various aspects of both 
concepts and employed different measures of re-
ligious and mental health dimensions [1, 2]. The 
results of these studies have been equivocal and 
are difficult to integrate due to the different def-
initions and divergent methodologies regarding 
both religiousness and mental health. Providing 
a definite answer as to whether religious people 
are in better or worse mental health that others 
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is extremely challenging [3, 4]. Therefore, exam-
ining the positive or negative effects of religious-
ness on mental health requires addressing some 
methodological and conceptual issues that have 
been underlined throughout the relevant psychi-
atric and psychological literature.

First, it is extremely difficult to establish the 
direction of relationships between religiousness 
and mental health. Lisa Miller and Brien S. Kel-
ly point out that researchers are often forced to 
analyse a narrow spectrum of religious variables 
and compare them with a wide range of clin-
ical and health indicators [5]. The correlations 
which can be found between religious and men-
tal health variables do not necessarily reveal the 
directionality of their relationship. They only 
point statistically to either a positive or a nega-
tive relationship. It might be that religious fac-
tors increase one’s well-being or that healthier 
individuals are inclined to attend religious serv-
ices more often. In a given situation, the cause 
of pathological behaviour can be twofold: reli-
gious activities can be distorted and lead to in-
appropriate expressions of religiousness, or the 
person may demonstrate mental disorder behav-
iour that will manifests itself in a pathological 
religious form. The proper explanation of these 
phenomena is very important, both for the over-
all image of religion, and establishing the objec-
tive and scientifically confirmed impact of reli-
gion on the mental and social functioning of the 
individual. Therefore, determining causal prec-
edence in correlational studies is extremely diffi-
cult to establish. Longitudinal survey studies are 
required to reveal the direction of causality.

Second, the concept of religiousness is multi-
dimensional and that may have multiple effects 
on mental health indicators. As various authors 
observe religion is a complex construct that com-
prises several dimensions of human function-
ing e.g., cognitive, emotional, motivational, and 
behavioural [6]. The effects of specific religious 
dimensions may thus neutralise each other, di-
minishing their separate influence and resulting 
in varied patterns of association. The method of 
evaluating the relationship of specific religious 
dimensions with mental health appears more 
productive than assessing global connections 
[7]. This approach can differentiate between dif-
ferent facets of religiousness and discriminate 

the degree to which religious variables are inter-
twined with mental health ones.

The analysis of results from many studies car-
ried out by Charles D. Batson, Patricia Schoen-
rade, and Larry W. Ventis provides a good ex-
ample of examining religion from different per-
spectives [8]. Drawing on the model of extrin-
sic, intrinsic and quest religious orientations 
the researchers investigated their relationships 
with mental health. The findings demonstrat-
ed a negative relationship between the extrin-
sic orientation and mental health. In the majori-
ty of studies analysed by Batson and colleagues, 
the extrinsic orientation was negatively associ-
ated with absence of illness, appropriate social 
behaviour, freedom from worry and guilt, per-
sonal competence and control, and open mind-
edness and flexibility. In contrast, the relation-
ship between the intrinsic orientation and psy-
chological well-being was positive. In the major-
ity of studies, the intrinsic orientation positively 
correlated with absence of illness, appropriate 
social behaviour, freedom from worry and guilt, 
competence and control, and personal organi-
zation. The quest dimension did not show any 
clear relationship with various indices of mental 
health. Some studies pointed to positive corre-
lations, while others demonstrated negative as-
sociations. This outcome might be due to either 
the scarcity of research in this area, or it may 
reflect no discernible associations of quest with 
mental health. 

Further studies revealed similar associations 
between measures of religiousness and men-
tal health. John Maltby and Lisa Day found that 
depressive symptoms were positively associ-
ated with two forms of extrinsic religiousness: 
personal and social [9]. The same destructive 
symptoms were negatively related to intrinsic 
religiousness. However, the results pointed to 
interesting differences between genders: there 
were no statistically significant correlations be-
tween intrinsic and extrinsic religious orienta-
tions and trait anxiety in males, but there was a 
positive association with extrinsic religiousness 
in females. 

The other most common dimensions of reli-
giousness assessed in research on religion and 
mental health are attendance at religious servic-
es, salience of religious identity, prayer and re-
ligious beliefs. Frequency of attendance at reli-
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gious services was associated with greater psy-
chological well-being in most studies [10, 11], 
although some of them revealed negative links 
[12, 13]. Salience of religious identity positive-
ly related to indices of psychological well-be-
ing [14]. As regards prayer the links with men-
tal health were more complex and dependent 
on the type of prayer. Colloquial and meditative 
prayer showed positive associations with such 
measures of well-being as life satisfaction, exis-
tential satisfaction, and happiness. Meditative 
prayer turned out to be the most important pre-
dictor of religious experiences. In contrast, peti-
tionary and ritualistic prayers, although related 
to some well-being measures, correlated posi-
tively with negative affect [15]. 

Using the Post-Critical Belief scale Beata 
Zarzycka and Jacek Śliwak showed that three 
dimensions of religiousness had significant re-
lations with anxiety [16]. Orthodoxy (the person 
claims that there is only one true answer to reli-
gious questions and this answer is accepted by 
religious authorities) correlated negatively with 
suspiciousness and positively with guilt prone-
ness in the whole sample. Among women, His-
torical Relativism (the person accepts the exist-
ence of God but less than orthodox individuals 
do) negatively correlated with suspiciousness, 
lack of integration, general anxiety and covert 
anxiety. Among men, Historical Relativism pos-
itively correlated with tension and emotional 
instability, general anxiety, covert anxiety and 
overt anxiety. External Critique (the person dis-
plays some tendency toward disbelief, yet reli-
gion usually plays a negative or ambivalent role 
in his/her life) was correlated with suspicious-
ness among men.

Overall, the results demonstrate that associa-
tions between religiousness and mental health 
are highly dependent upon the dimensions of 
the religious and health constructs being used. 
What matters are the person’s inner approach to 
religion and the extent to which the individuals 
identify themselves as religious. Engaging in re-
ligious activities without a psychological com-
mitment to them may reflect rather routine ac-
tions that do not entail any beneficial outcomes 
for one’s well-being. More meaningful behav-
iour is required if it is to bring fruit to mental 
health. Furthermore, the preponderance of em-
pirical research suggests that the associations 

between religion and mental health are mediat-
ed by some mechanisms [1, 5, 17]. The mecha-
nisms most studied and recognised by psychia-
trists and psychologists are: health behaviours, 
psychological states, coping, and social support. 
They may operate simultaneously and, in many 
cases, overlap with one another.

Third, the culture in which individuals are em-
bedded plays a very important role in influenc-
ing how they characterise the relationships be-
tween religiousness and mental health, interpret 
mental symptoms, and describe their thoughts 
and behaviours. Existing cultural patterns and 
norms are vital to understanding both religious 
behaviours and mental schemas [18, 19]. Cul-
tural elements e.g., specific cultural cognitions, 
emotions, morality, personality, and social be-
haviour shape religions and religious experi-
ence. They help us explain, to some extent, why 
religion seems to function in similar ways across 
cultural contexts and how religious motivations 
can lead to some universal consequences regard-
ing intra-individual functioning and interper-
sonal relations. There is also increased recogni-
tion in clinical care and in research in psychia-
try of the importance of religion and spirituality 
in our patients’ lives as these factors may be rel-
evant to understanding human functioning and 
explaining pathological symptoms [20]. Cultur-
al differences influence forms of religious delu-
sions, hallucinations, and the preponderance of 
certain types of religious rituals that can resem-
ble particular disorders e.g., obsessive-compul-
sive disorder (OCD). 

There is strong evidence that culture deter-
mines the interaction between religiousness and 
mental health and disorder. It becomes observ-
able in specific religious activities that are close-
ly related to personality states. The particular 
modes of expression and behaviour prescribed 
by the world’s religions strongly influence the 
daily lives of their believers, and therefore the 
manifestation of the believers’ symptoms must 
be considered within the particular schemas of 
each religion [1, 3]. Furthermore, Western psy-
chiatry and psychology are predominantly a Eu-
ropean and American phenomenon, and their 
findings and therapies are mostly applicable to 
individuals living within these cultural bound-
aries. In contrast, the standards of mental health 
found in other cultures do not necessarily have 
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to match Western criteria e.g., in some African 
communities a person would be regarded as in-
sane if he or she did not believe that the spir-
its of the dead actively influence an individu-
al’s life [5]. This ambivalent situation challenges 
researchers to take into account different view-
points related to religious and mental health fac-
tors.

In considering the above methodological and 
conceptual points, it is apparent that a deeper 
and more refined model of analysis is required 
for understanding the complex associations of 
dimensions of religiousness with mental health. 
The coping mechanism may provide a broad-
er framework that would enable us to compre-
hend those associations and embed them into 
the mental health context. 

2. Religious coping as a potential media-
tor in the relationships between religion 
and mental health

A very promising area of analysing the re-
lationships between religiousness and mental 
health lies in the field of coping. According to 
Kenneth I. Pargament religiousness can be seen 
in three facets as: an element of coping, a con-
tributor to coping, and a product of coping [21, 
22]. At the first level religion serves as an ele-
ment of coping, enabling individuals to apply 
their religious beliefs and activities to stressful 
situations. They might contain cognitive activi-
ties (e.g., finding a religious explanation in the 
event), behavioural activities (e.g., confessing 
one’s sins), and passive (e.g., asking for a super-
natural intervention) and collaborative respons-
es (e.g., doing one’s best and giving the rest up 
to God). At the second level religion is viewed 
as a force having the potential to shape coping 
processes. Religious factors can influence an in-
dividual’s appraisals of events and perceived 
ability to cope. Through guidelines and princi-
ples that are embedded in religious teachings, 
religion can encourage people to behave in cer-
tain ways. At the third level religion is under-
stood as a product of coping. This can be illus-
trated by the situation in which painful experi-
ences are able to draw a person closer to God. 

The underlying assumption of the ability of re-
ligion to influence the coping process lies in the 

observation that religion is more than a defence 
mechanism as it was viewed by Sigmund Freud 
[23]. The empirical evidence suggests that reli-
gion has been connected with several functions 
in coping that extend beyond anxiety reduction, 
including meaning making [24], personal mas-
tery and growth [25], and the search for the sa-
cred [26]. Religious motivation can serve a wide 
variety of needs for individuals. Research also 
indicates that religion is not generally associated 
with the blanket denial of the situation. Rather 
than inspiring denial, religion stimulates reinter-
pretations of negative events through the sacred 
lens e.g., a traumatic situation can be viewed as 
an opportunity for spiritual growth [23]. The en-
couraging force of religion is clearly evident in 
the religious rites that offer individuals hope and 
enable them to overcome grief and pain. In addi-
tion, religion is linked with both passive and ac-
tive coping which refutes the accusation of pas-
sivity with regard to religious beliefs. The re-
search conducted by Pargament demonstrated 
that measures of religiousness were more linked 
to forms of active coping than passive coping 
[27]. 

Examining the relationships between religion 
and coping, Pargament points out that religious 
coping acts as a mediator between general reli-
gious orientations and the outcomes of negative 
life events [22]. Although religious beliefs can at 
times impede the coping process, they also en-
able people to understand and deal with stress-
ful situations. Religious involvement may foster 
more effective ways of dealing with stressful sit-
uations and conditions [2]. Consequently, more 
effective coping strategies can lead to improved 
mental health through a reduction in harmful 
health behaviours (e.g., less stress) and an im-
provement in psychological states (e.g., higher 
optimism and well-being).

Applying religious coping to solving exis-
tential problems Pargament initially identified 
three coping styles that reflect the ways in which 
people grapple with challenging situations [27]: 
(1) a deferring approach – the individual relin-
quishes the responsibility for problem solving 
to God; (2) a self-directing approach – the indi-
vidual perceives God as someone who gives him 
or her the skills and resources required to solve 
problems autonomously; (3) a collaborative ap-
proach – the individual perceives God as a part-
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ner who takes part in the responsibility for prob-
lem solving.  The collaborative problem-solving 
style turned out to be more common than the de-
ferring or self-directing styles.

Subsequent research conducted by Pargament 
and colleagues specified the above styles, allow-
ing the provision of a more comprehensive ar-
ray of 21 types of religious coping activities that 
were named “methods” [28]. The coping meth-
ods comprise a wide range of mechanisms: ac-
tive, passive, and interactive strategies; emotion-
focused and problem-focused approaches; and 
cognitive, behavioural, interpersonal, and spir-
itual domains. In order to measure those meth-
ods the researchers constructed the RCOPE scale 
that demonstrates five key religious functions: 
the search for meaning, the search for mastery 
and control, the search for comfort and close-
ness to God, the search for intimacy and close-
ness to God, and the search for a life transforma-
tion. The results obtained in many studies sug-
gest that the RCOPE is a useful tool to assess re-
ligious and spiritual resources used in coping 
with a variety of major stressors [23, 28, 29]. 

The main question that arises in relation to re-
ligious coping is why religion is so potent and 
effective in dealing with daily stressful and chal-
lenging events. The answer to this question is 
not clear, in part because religion is a multifac-
eted phenomenon that serves many individual 
and social functions. Nevertheless, it is possible 
to pinpoint three main dimensions in which reli-
gion meets human needs: (1) the need for mean-
ing, (2) the need for control, and (3) the need for 
relationships [30]. They are all based on the as-
sumption that the search for meaning is of cen-
tral importance to human functioning, and that 
religion is uniquely capable of facilitating that 
search.

In recent psychological and psychiatric stud-
ies on religion, there has been an increasing in-
terest in examining religion in terms of meaning. 
Probably the most popular definition of religion 
describes it as “a search for meaning in ways re-
lated to the sacred” [22, p. 32]. Religion is es-
sential to the global meaning systems of many 
people, because it provides individuals with an 
integrated set of beliefs, goals and meanings 
which can be used in explaining intricacies of 
the world and in dealing with personal situa-
tions and problems. Recent research has repeat-

edly shown that religion is a powerful source of 
meaning in life [24, 26, 31]. Despite the fact that 
the relationship between religion and meaning 
is intimate and complex many people find in re-
ligious beliefs a sense of purpose, understanding 
and psychological support.

The results obtained by Dariusz Krok revealed 
that religion conceptualised as the religious 
meaning system enables individuals to com-
prehend their lives and the world and to dis-
cover purpose and meaning in their lives [32]. 
It allows us to assess religion as a central factor 
in the life purposes of many people, taking into 
account their ultimate motivation and goals for 
living. The religious meaning system was asso-
ciated with higher levels of subjective and psy-
chological well-being, and their relationships 
were mediated by such psychosocial factors as 
a sense of coherence, meaning in life, and social 
support. It implies that meaning plays a medi-
ational role in the relationship of religion with 
mental health.

Religion can offer a sense of control over life’s 
countless uncertainties that is extremely impor-
tant when coping with stressful and challenging 
situations. When threatened with harm or pain, 
individuals often tend to control and even pre-
dict the outcomes of the events that affect them. 
This inclination is deeply rooted in cognitive 
mechanisms directed at constructing person-
al mastery in one’s life [33]. Religious activities 
such as prayer and rituals can strengthen a per-
son’s feeling of mastery which in turn enhances 
a sense of self-control and control of one’s world. 
When people face uncertainty and helplessness 
that limit their sense of control and mastery, re-
ligious beliefs may provide a subjective sense of 
control to enable individuals regain their will-
power and strength [30]. Therefore, religion as a 
coping strategy imbues life with significance as 
it facilitates people’s efforts to interpret their ex-
periences in terms of existential meaning.

The last function of religion linked to meaning 
is the need for relationships. Roy F. Baumeister 
and Mark R. Leary emphasise that people have a 
basic psychological need to feel closely connect-
ed to others, and that caring, affectionate bonds 
from close relationships are a major part of hu-
man behaviour [34]. They use the term “need to 
belong” to illustrate the observable fact that hu-
man beings are fundamentally and pervasively 
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motivated to engage in social relationships and 
have a strong desire to form and maintain en-
during interpersonal attachments. Connections 
and interactions are indispensable throughout 
one’s entire life. Through its services and cere-
monies religion can connect individuals to each 
other and their groups. Religious beliefs pro-
vide norms and standards that socialise mem-
bers into community, and concurrently suppress 
destructive and undesirable behaviour. There is 
strong empirical data demonstrating that social 
support offered by church communities is ben-
eficial to people’s well-being and mental health, 
although at times it can have adverse effects [2, 
30, 35]. People experience religious influences 
through their interpretations and motivations 
of daily events, and religious behaviours can ei-
ther strengthen social cohesion (altruism, inter-
personal approval) or reinforce divisions (prej-
udice).

The evidence presented in this section sup-
ports the idea that a religious framework can 
be a mediator in the relationships between reli-
gion and mental health. Religious coping strate-
gies influence appraisals and affect different di-
mensions of mental health. The effects are deter-
mined, in part, by a sense of meaning and sig-
nificance which is strongly embedded in internal 
religious structures. Further analysis is required 
to assess the extent to which religious coping can 
increase people’s well-being and consequently 
their mental health.

3. The role of religious coping in increas-
ing well-being

Religion hardly precludes stress and suffering 
as they are “inscribed in the equation of life”. 
Yet, religiousness may help individuals buffer 
stress and increase their level of well-being. A re-
ligious belief system enables individuals to find 
meanings in stressful and traumatic life events 
that are otherwise difficult, if not impossible, to 
explain e.g. death, terminal illness, unexpected 
accident. The beneficial role of religion appears 
mainly in times of stress which is rather logi-
cal given the fact that studies suggest that the 
cause of everyday events is likely to be only in-
frequently attributed to the religious realm [7]. 
The religious interpretative framework that is 

based on the meaning system empowers people 
to make sense of their stressful life events.

According to Pargament, religious coping 
methods can be grouped into two main catego-
ries: positive and negative [22, 23]. These were 
established on a basis of higher order factor anal-
yses that considered similarities and differenc-
es between their content and effects. The effica-
cy of religious coping can be examined by apply-
ing those methods to the outcomes of stressful 
situations. The positive and negative methods 
of religious coping can be measured by using 
the Brief RCOPE scale that is a shorter form of 
the RCOPE. Confirmatory factor analyses of the 
Brief RCOPE indicated that the two-factor solu-
tion (two distinctive methods) provided a rea-
sonable fit for the data. The scale is divided into 
two subscales, each consisting of seven items, 
which identify clusters of positive and negative 
religious coping methods.

The positive religious coping method depicts 
secure relationships with God, a sense of spiri-
tual connectedness with others, and a belief that 
life has a greater benevolent meaning. The meth-
od reflects spiritual support, collaborative reli-
gious coping, and benevolent religious refram-
ing. In general, positive religious coping con-
centrates on accepting God as a partner who 
could help in stressful situations and active at-
tempts to find strength, support and guidance 
in crises. The negative religious coping meth-
od represents insecure relationships with God 
and strains between individuals, signs of spiri-
tual tension, conflict and struggle with God and 
others, as manifested by negative reappraisals 
of God’s powers (i.e. feeling abandoned or pun-
ished by God), demonic reappraisals (i.e. feel-
ing the devil is involved in the stressor), spiritu-
al questioning and doubting, and interperson-
al religious discontent [27, 36]. In general, neg-
ative religious coping expresses the attitude of 
perceiving God as one who punishes and spiri-
tual discontent in difficult situations.

Through these two coping methods religion 
provides people with comprehensive and co-
hesive structures of meaning that enable them 
to cope with challenging events. The results of 
studies conducted by Pargament and other re-
searchers revealed that religious coping can be 
helpful or harmful, depending upon the partic-
ular type of religious coping strategy employed 
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[28, 29]. The positive and negative religious cop-
ing methods turned out to show different con-
nections to measures of mental health.

The results of a large meta-analysis (49 rele-
vant studies with a total of 105 effect sizes) con-
ducted by Gene G. Ano and Erin B. Vasconcelles 
demonstrated that positive and negative forms 
of religious coping are related to positive and 
negative psychological adjustment to stress, re-
spectively [36]. The authors decided to examine 
four types of relationships between religious 
coping and mental health: positive religious cop-
ing with positive psychological adjustment, pos-
itive religious coping with negative psycholog-
ical adjustment, negative religious coping with 
positive psychological adjustment, and negative 
religious coping with negative psychological ad-
justment.

The findings indicated that a moderate pos-
itive relationship exists between positive reli-
gious coping strategies and positive outcomes 
to stressful events. Individuals who applied pos-
itive religious coping strategies such as benev-
olent religious reappraisals, collaborative re-
ligious coping, and seeking spiritual support 
tended to experience more stress-related growth, 
spiritual growth, and positive affect. They were 
also characterised by higher self-esteem. This 
result may suggest that positive religious cop-
ing facilitates adaptive functions, especially in 
times of challenging events [21]. Positive reli-
gious coping was also inversely related to nega-
tive psychological adjustment. That is, individ-
uals who used positive religious coping strate-
gies displayed less depression, anxiety, and dis-
tress. Thus, religious coping can serve adaptive 
functions in terms of decreasing the level of neg-
ative mental health states. 

Rather surprisingly, negative religious coping 
was not inversely related to positive psycholog-
ical adjustment. That is, individuals who used 
those negative strategies were not character-
ised by lower self-esteem, less purpose in life, 
or lower spiritual growth. One explanation for 
this finding is that negative religious coping is 
balanced by using positive religious strategies 
which in turn prevent individuals from experi-
encing too many negative outcomes. This inter-
pretation is consistent with another study sug-
gesting that personality dispositions interact 
with religious coping and that using negative re-

ligious coping may be balanced by positive dis-
positions [37]. Finally, negative religious coping 
strategies were positively associated with nega-
tive psychological adjustment to stress. In oth-
er words, individuals who reported using nega-
tive forms of religious coping experienced more 
depression, anxiety, and distress. This finding 
was confirmed by the relationship of negative 
religious coping to psychological distress among 
early adolescents [38].

Further research examining the nature of reli-
gious coping revealed that individuals enter the 
coping process with orienting and meaning sys-
tems that influence the specific ways in which 
they interpret and handle stressful events. Fac-
ing challenging situations, individuals draw on 
religious coping methods as a part of their gen-
eral orienting and meaning systems, which in 
turn influence their abilities to cope with adver-
sity and life stress [24, 31]. It is especially dis-
cernable in coping with major stress situations 
e.g., among patients diagnosed with cancer [39] 
or people who experienced traumatic events 
[40]. The orienting and meaning systems ap-
pear to influence the types of coping strategies 
that are used in specific situations. The stron-
ger and more constructive are the orienting and 
meaning systems that individuals employ, the 
more positive are the health outcomes that can 
be attained.

Conclusions

To summarise, the article indicates that reli-
giousness can either improve the mental states 
of troubled persons or it can exacerbate situa-
tional stress. It is a consequence of the many re-
ligious and spiritual references with which peo-
ple surround themselves, constructing a specif-
ic sacred context that makes an impact on major 
life events. Although the associations between 
religiousness and mental health appear to be 
very complex and multifaceted, the current find-
ings show that they are highly dependent upon 
the religious and health constructs employed in 
the research. Religious coping can function as a 
mediator between general religious orientations 
and mental health dimensions. It has two main 
forms: positive and negative that are linked to 
positive and negative mental health outcomes, 
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respectively. The effects of religious coping 
methods on mental health are determined, at 
least partially, by the structures of orientation 
and meaning that are strongly embedded in in-
ternal religious schemas. While facing challeng-
ing and stressful situations individuals heavily 
rely upon them in order to buffer stress and in-
crease subjective well-being.
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